
 

June 2021 Spirituality Calendar 
Encourage your child to follow this calendar each day of June! 

 
 

  Sunday        Monday        Tuesday     Wednesday    Thursday  Friday          Saturday 

   

1 
 

God is in all 
creation. Look out 
the window for five 
minutes. Where do 
you see God? 

2 
 

Breathe in & blow 
out quickly. Wind, 
breeze and breath 
all require air. What 
else is silent yet so 
important? 

 

3 
 

Is there a “junk 
drawer” in your 
house? Ask 
permission to clean 
it out. 

4   
 

Praise God today by 
enjoying time outside 
exploring God’s 
creation. 
  

 

5 
 

St Boniface was first to 
use an evergreen as a 
Christmas tree. Why 
did he choose it to 
celebrate Jesus’ birth? 

 

6   Corpus Christi 
Body & Blood of Christ  
 

Jesus gave us himself in 
Holy Communion to save 
us. In what ways does 
Jesus give you strength? 

7 
 

Grandparents are 
special family members. 
Write a note to a 
grandparent. 

8 
 

Tell each of your 
family members 
that you love them. 
 
 

 

9 
Caring for each 
other in a family is 
important. Think of 
one way to care for 
each member of 
your family & do it! 

 

10 
 

The Old Testament 
says, if your 
enemies are hungry, 
give them food to 
eat. What does this  
mean to you? 

11 
Sacred Heart of Jesus 
 

Find a picture of the 
Sacred Heart of Jesus 
and say a prayer to 
thank Him for his gift of 
love & salvation.  

12                                   
Immaculate Heart of 
Mary 
 
Find a statue of Mary  
and pray a Hail Mary. 
 

 

13   
 

When you go to Mass 
today, thank God for three 
blessings you have 
received.  

14 
 

Make “Be Happy” cards 
to give family and 
neighbors. Giving to 
others makes you 
happy too! 

15 
 

Umbrellas help us 
stay safe in rainy 
weather. How does 
Christ help us stay 
safe? 

 

16 
 

Take a ball & bounce 
it. Did it bounce 
back to you? Just 
like the ball, faith 
bounces back to you 
after hard times. 

17 
 

We light candles at 
Baptism, on Birthday 
cakes & during 
Advent. Why is 
lighting candles so 
important to faith?  

18  
  
Share with you family 
ways you try to follow 
God in your life. 
  

19  
 
Do you have a worry on 
your heart? Say a 
prayer and give that 
worry to God.  

20 Father’s Day 
 

Make a card or write a 
note for Fr. Klasinski or Fr. 
Cosgrove thanking them 
for all they do. Drop it at 
the business office or in 
the offertory box in church.  

 

21 
 

As the seasons change, 
are there differences in 
the world around you? 
Watch for these 
differences. 

22 
 

Do a random act of 
kindness for 
someone in your 
family today. 
  

 

23 
 

Do a chore to earn 

some change and 

bring it to church to 

donate at mass this 

weekend. 

 
24   John the Baptist 
 
Jesus & John were 
family. Name those 
in your family. Thank 
God for them. 
  

25 
 
Think of someone who 
has hurt you and say a 
prayer to God for 
them.  

 

26 
 

Every day has new 
adventures. Thank God 
for the world and for a 
new day. 
 

27 
 

Celebrate the Mass: 
online or in person with 
someone you love. 

 

28 
Jesus calmed the storm 
for the disciples. What 
can he do for you? 

29 Ss Peter & Paul 
 

Spread God’s love; 

do a random act of 

kindness today. 

30    Pray for 
schools. Pray for 
your teachers and 
for your education. 
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